
1 
 





3 
 

to stabilize fragile countries. The International Development Assistance (IDA) replenishment 
reflects the concern about fragility and 30% of the resources would be directed to fragile countries. 
He called for multiple initiatives to ensure equitable vaccine distribution and noted that the Bank 
would provide up to 20 billion dollars for this cause. He underscored the importance of focusing 
on preparedness and helping fragile states to grow their economies. He cited Afghanistan as one 
of many examples where the international community needed to urgently address growing food 
insecurity and economic collapse. 

7. The Director of “La Femme Rurale”, Ms. Sirebara Fatoumata Diallo, pointed out that 
overcoming the socio-economic disparities exacerbated by the pandemic is only possible if all 
stakeholders are involved in the process, particularly women. She highlighted the importance of 
involving women in the recovery process, including through inter-community dialogue. However, 
in conflict and transition situations, mobilization of communities to better respond to the pandemic 
and conduct activities related to peace and conflict prevention is made difficult by the context of 
insecurity. The Government in Mali had reduced the tax burdens for companies, and increased 
funding for the sector that is most affected by the crisis and supported households by, for example, 
covering their electricity costs for a period of three months. Three pillars of resilience must be at 
center of action right now: securing livelihoods and improving social protection of vulnerable 
communities, sustainably strengthening the food sector, and supporting efforts to strengthen 
governance. 

8.  The Managing Director of Equity BCDC and Vice-Chair of Board of the UN Global 
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United Nations. One speaker expressed caution against the intermingling of peace and 
development funding.  

 Member States reiterated their commitment to multilateralism and to further solidify 
collaboration and coordination between ECOSOC and the PBC to promote vaccine equity, 
mitigate the impact of Covid-19, ensure protection of hard-won gains in peacebuilding and 
development, and accelerate achievement of the SDGs. This was echoed in the ECOSOC-PBC 
joint statement issued after the meeting. In this context, many welcomed the proposal of having 


