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At the same time, we are happy to see that, while as a result of the digital gap between 
Member States, the DPI is continuing to improve upon its use of the traditional means of 
communication, including TV, radio and print materials. 

We also appreciate the commitment and coordination of the DPI towards obtaining huge 
support for the attainment of the MDGs in the international and local level. 

We refer to the report A/AC.198/2005/3. We highlight the fact that the DPI has acknowledged 
that there is no consensus on how to move forward the process of rationalization. 

In this respect, the Rio Group will favor making the work of the DPI more effective, particularly 
in disseminating public information and establishing links to civil society and public in general, 
in particular in developing countries. 

Last year the Rio Group expressed the convenience of not going on with the model of 
regionalization started in Europe without considering other alternatives and with assessing the 
process in Western Europe. The process, not only did not produce savings but showed to be 
expensive, at least at the beginning, and the DPI has no additional resources to move the 
process forward, as stated in the Report. Instead, the Report proposes a more strategic 
communicational approach by which UNICs will get broader programmatic functions, giving 
orientation and support in terms of strategic communication to other offices in their region. 

The Rio Group understands that this new proposal of the DPI is not a preparatory measure to 
reassume in the future the process of rationalization or closure of UNICs, but it is referred to 
the way by which the existing UNICs will become more efficient to convey the peace message 
of the United Nations. The regionalization process is over. 

In concluding our remarks on this item, the Rio Group supports the careful study of all reform 
possibilities within our reach, so that the DPI — always in consultation with the Member 
States and within the limits established by the General Assembly — can change its 
functioning in such a way as to, effectively, improve the public information and 
communications services of the UN in the world. 

Mr. Chairperson, 

The Rio Group attaches great importance to multilingualism and, therefore, could not fail to 
mention the need for this concept to be respected and applied in the dissemination of 
information by this Organization. Especially with respect to the UN website, that as a result of  



We wish, as well, to emphasize the need to double our efforts so that the UN website may be 
made accessible to persons with disabilities, especially given the relevance that the subject of 
disability has taken on lately in the United Nations. Neither the language, nor the format 
should be an obstacle for the dissemination of the universal message of the Organization. We 
encourage the DPI to systematically request the various offices to present their subject matter 
in accessible formats, as a part of the efforts to create a new conscience in the Organization 
and in the world regarding this issue. 

Mr. Chairperson, 

The Rio Group also wishes to express its appreciation for traditional forms of communication, 
in particular radio, which remains an effective and far-reaching media form, especially in 
developing countries, where access to advanced technologies is many times still limfora.7 (f)3n (l9.2135 0 Td
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